
Description Est Gallons

Gallons of Yellow  GA Spec. 5B  (400 5 GAL 

PAILS)
2000 NO BID NO BID 12.20 GAL NO BID 10.89 GAL 12.67 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Gallons of White  GA Spec. 5A  (200 5 GAL 

PAILS)
1000 NO BID NO BID 12.20 GAL NO BID 9.79 GAL 11.78 GAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID 36600.00 NO BID 31570.00 37120.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Description Est LBS

24000 lb glass spheres   (480 50LB BAGS) 24000 NO BID 0.58 LBS NO BID .435 LBS .355 LBS .42 LBS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID 13920.00 NO BID 10440.00 8520.000 10080.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Description Est Qty Each

12” X 12” 50 NO BID NO BID 2.76 NO BID NO BID 3.47 2.36 2.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.34

12” x 18” 100 NO BID NO BID 4.18 NO BID NO BID 5.22 3.39 3.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.01

24” x 30” 300 NO BID NO BID 13.88 NO BID NO BID 15.06 11.30 12.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 16.70

12” x 36” 200 NO BID NO BID 8.33 NO BID NO BID 9.04 6.78 7.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.02

18” x 18” 100 NO BID NO BID 6.27 NO BID NO BID 7.81 5.09 5.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID 7.52

30” x 36” 50 NO BID NO BID 20.10 NO BID NO BID 22.59 16.95 18.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 25.05

24” x 10” 50 NO BID NO BID 4.58 NO BID NO BID 6.94 3.77 4.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.58

18” x 24” 300 NO BID NO BID 8.33 NO BID NO BID 9.04 6.78 7.31 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.02

30"x30"x30" (R1-2 Triangle Yeild) 50 NO BID NO BID 7.78 NO BID NO BID 17.50 8.48 8.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID 11.69

     DIAMOND        

30” x 30” 250 NO BID NO BID 17.31 NO BID NO BID 18.82 14.13 15.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID 20.88

     OCTAGON        

30” x 30” 400 NO BID NO BID 15.93 NO BID NO BID 18.82 14.13 14.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID 19.98

NO BID NO BID 21884.50 NO BID NO BID 25099.00 18385.50 19424.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 26768.00

Description Est Qty Each

12” x 36” Object Marker 200 NO BID NO BID 4.19 NO BID NO BID 13.50 3.10 3.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.04

30” x 30” Stop 400 NO BID NO BID 8.73 NO BID NO BID 28.15 6.50 7.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.50

18” x 18” Speed Advisory 50 NO BID NO BID 3.15 NO BID NO BID 9.56 2.34 2.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.78

30"x30"x30" (R1-2 Triangle Yeild) 50 NO BID NO BID 5.24 NO BID NO BID 25.00 3.90 3.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.10

SIGN FACES (Pressure Sensitive, Prismatic Face) HIGH 

INTENSITY

SIGN BLANKS  .080 Aluminum pre-drilled

FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA
TRAFFIC PAINT AND SIGN MATERIALS BID 20-0227 (DETAILED) TABULATION

*** Pricing is below is based on UOM ****

SUPPLIERS

TRANSAFE INC
OSBURN ASSOCIATES 

INC
VILCAN INC LIGHTLE ENTERPRISESMD SOLUTIONS SHERWIN WILLIAMS TRAFFIC SIGNS INC

SAFETY ZONE 

SPECIALISTS
XCESSORIES SQUARED

NIPPON CARBIDE 

INDUSTRIES

TRAFFIC PAINT:  Water based, quick drying latex shipped in 5 

gallon plastic pails with DOT Certification

GLASS SPHERES  GA. SPEC. (AASHTO M247 TYPE 1) IN 50 

# BAGS

SWARCO INDUSTRIES OZARK MATERIALS LLC



         

18” x 24” 300 NO BID NO BID 4.19 NO BID NO BID 13.50 3.12 3.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID 5.04

24” x 24” 250 NO BID NO BID 5.58 NO BID NO BID 18.00 4.16 4.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID 6.72

30” x 30” 250 NO BID NO BID 8.72 NO BID NO BID 28.13 6.50 7.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID 10.50

36” x 36” 100 NO BID NO BID 12.56 NO BID NO BID 40.50 9.36 11.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.12

24” x 30” 300 NO BID NO BID 6.98 NO BID NO BID 22.50 5.20 6.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID 8.40

NO BID NO BID 12931.50 NO BID NO BID 42070.50 9633.00 11448.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 15760.00

Description Est Qty Each        

Black 30” x 50 yds 4 rolls NO BID NO BID 257.28 NO BID NO BID 439.00 270.00 389.55 NO BID NO BID 300.00 431.25

White 30” x 50 yds 6 Rolls NO BID NO BID 265.00 NO BID NO BID 439.00 270.00 326.25 NO BID NO BID 300.00 345.00

Orange 30” x 50 yds 1 Roll NO BID NO BID 265.00 NO BID NO BID 439.00 270.00 326.25 NO BID NO BID 300.00 345.00

Red     30” x 50 yds 1 Rolls NO BID NO BID 265.00 NO BID NO BID 439.00 270.00 326.25 NO BID NO BID 300.00 345.00

Blue    30” x 50 yds 1 Rolls NO BID NO BID 265.00 NO BID NO BID 439.00 270.00 326.25 NO BID NO BID 300.00 345.00

Yellow 30 x 50 yds 1 Roll NO BID NO BID 265.00 NO BID NO BID 439.00 270.00 326.25 NO BID NO BID 300.00 345.00

Green 30” x 50 yds 1 Roll NO BID NO BID 265.00 NO BID NO BID 439.00 270.00 326.25 NO BID NO BID 300.00 345.00

Barricade Tape 6” x 50 yds 8 Rolls NO BID NO BID 95.00 NO BID NO BID 165.00 111.00 68.48 NO BID NO BID 63.75 105.00

       

6” x 50 yds 8 Rolls NO BID NO BID 18.70 NO BID NO BID 22.50 22.75 25.50 NO BID NO BID 37.50 21.00

12” x 50 yds 8 Rolls NO BID NO BID 36.48 NO BID NO BID 45.00 43.75 51.00 NO BID NO BID 75.00 42.00

30” x 50 yds 5 Rolls NO BID NO BID 93.70 NO BID NO BID 112.50 105.00 127.50 NO BID NO BID 187.50 105.00

NO BID NO BID 5614.06 NO BID NO BID 9007.50 5995.00 6944.29 NO BID NO BID 6847.50 7389.00

Description Est Qty Each

10’ 1000 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 45.00 NO BID 22.80 NO BID 31.95 NO BID 27.10 31950

12’ 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 58.80 NO BID 27.36 NO BID 38.35 NO BID 32.52 3835

3’ ANCHOR 1100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 9.35 NO BID 10.77 NO BID 12.95 NO BID 11.96 14245

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 60665.00 NO BID 37383.00 NO BID 50030.00 NO BID 43508.00 50030

Description Est Qty Each

 (90 degree) 150 2.90 NO BID 3.38 NO BID NO BID 2.36 4.25 3.35 NO BID 8.85 NO BID 2.98

(180 degree) 150 2.90 NO BID 3.38 NO BID NO BID 2.48 4.25 3.35 NO BID 8.85 NO BID 2.98

SIGN CROSSES (90 Degree) 200 2.90 NO BID 3.38 NO BID NO BID 3.55 4.25 3.62 NO BID 8.65 NO BID 2.98

1450.00 NO BID 1690.00 NO BID NO BID 1436.00 2125.00 1729.00 NO BID 4385.00 NO BID 1490.00

BARRICADE LIGHTS (6 VOLT FLASHER WITH SOLAR 

SWITCH)

TRANSFER TAPE-(paper)

SIGN MOUNTING BRACKETS (5.25 IN. BLADE HOLDER, 

SECURITY FOR FLAT BLADES)

ROLL  GOODS (Engineer Grade, Pressure Sensitive)

SIGN POST (SQUARE TUBING) 12Ga Green

U-CHANNEL POST CAPS

Various Messages and Colors for the Following Sizes



Description Est Qty Each

Lights 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 15.80 NO BID NO BID 22.50 NO BID NO BID 14.80

6 volt lantern batteries 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 3.72 NO BID NO BID 3.95 NO BID NO BID 2.75

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 1162.00 NO BID NO BID 1520.00 NO BID NO BID 1015.00


