

FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA  
 BID TABULATION  
 19-0219-1 Drainage Pipe  
 Due 2PM <sup>21</sup> February 2019

Supplier->	Mathis Trailers		Iadds Farm Supply		Foley products		Southeast Culvert		Contech Engineered Solutions		Old Castle				
PIPE SPEC	Pricing per foot with Delivery Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery NOT Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery NOT Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery NOT Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery NOT Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery NOT Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery NOT Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery Included	Pricing per foot with Delivery NOT Included	
RCP 12"	No bid		No bid	No bid											
RCP 15"											14.37	13.63			
RCP 18"											16.57	15.64			
RCP 24"											24.59	23.22			
RCP 30"											35.38	33.41			
RCP 36"											45.75	43.13			
RCP 42"											59.50	56.10			
RCP 48"											80.71	76.47			
CMP 12"	No bid		No bid		7.91	7.91	8.89	8.10	No bid						
CMP 15"					13.50	13.79	12.29	9.83			9.83	10.93	10.02		
CMP 18"					16.10	17.85	14.95	11.86			11.86	13.80	12.45		
CMP 24"					21.70	22.95	19.00	15.55			15.55	18.43	16.72		
CMP 30"					26.08	28.80	25.80	19.36			19.36	21.84	20.28		
CMP 36"					32.68	32.80	30.49	23.27			23.27	26.10	23.92		
CMP 42"					No bid	29.95	37.00	27.37			27.37	29.98	27.88		
CMP 48"					45.00	45.95	42.95	31.07			31.07	34.96	31.73		
Band 12"	No bid		No bid		7.91		16.20		No bid						
Band 15"					13.75	12.98	9.83				20.04				
Band 18"					16.50	15.29	11.86				24.90				
Band 24"					21.75	19.95	15.55				33.44				
Band 30"					26.10	25.25	19.36				40.56				
Band 36"					32.75	31.75	23.27				47.84				
Band 42"					No bid	36.95	27.37				55.76				
Band 48"					44.95	42.75	31.07				63.40				

Idendum 1

NO NO NO YES YES NO

THE BIDS ABOVE WERE READ ALOUD IN PUBLIC THIS 21ST DAY OF FEB 2019

X *[Signature]*