FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA

TRAFFIC PAINT AND SIGN MATERIALS

BID 17-0727 (DETAILED) TABULATION

*** Pricing is based on individual costs for evaluation****

SUPPLIERS

i i i Lightle Safety Zone | Hall Signs Inc Traffic Allied Tube Georgia Transafe American Nippon Potters Ind Pride Newman Signs [ Osburn Assoc. Roadsafe Sherwin Ozark
TRAFFIC PAINT: Water based, quick dr){lng latex shipped Traffic Signs s . y . s . Supplies N Correctional ) SWARCO Ind | Ennis Paint Inc pp‘ Vulcan IncJ | MD Solutions |Universal Signs . N 8 . ) N -~ .
in 5 gallon plastic pails with DOT Certification Enterprises Specialists Jenni R and Conduit Products Traffic Safety . Carbide Kendra . . ) Enterprises Inc David Inc Melinda Traffic Sys. [Williams Casey| Materials

James Watson s . . Distribution Ind Joseph . . Jon Sproul 9311  Zina Brooks Todd Koniar | Niel Lacy 614- | Larry Tritschler . "
256-435-5014 David Lightle | David Vespa |Kalbfleisch 800- Martin Warner Aarom Scott \rebi 678-508- Diane Weaver | Sadie Maugle 388-5900 336-436-9412 Andrew Kato | Stamper 800- 8888462745 873-2222 772-461-.665 Joseph Keen | Nygren 800- |Thompson 800{ Tyler Crews | Heistom 706- |Dyana Heartsill}
740-998-5363 | 863-984-1385 284-7446 800-882-5543 770-962-2222 | 904-284-1708 562-777-1810 552-3237 : 813-890-2133 437-9770 523-8917 404-227-1102 346-2636 334-371-2308
Description Est Gallons 721-332-1341 3686
S:'I'Egi of Yellow GA Spec. 5B (4005 GAL 2000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.95 No Bid 50.00 1181 No Bid No Bid 8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.40 No Bid No Bid 1098 8.75 8.5
S;'I'Egj of White GA Spec. SA (2005 GAL 1000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.80 No Bid 50.00 1217 No Bid No Bid 8.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.40 No Bid No Bid 1125 875 8.29
GLASS SPHERES GA. SPEC. (AASHTO M247 TYPE 1) IN
50 # BAGS
Description Est LBS
24000 Ib glass spheres (480 50LB BAGS) 24000 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.395 No Bid No Bid 0.44 No Bid 0.33 0.34 No Bid 0.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 0.46 0.39 No Bid
SIGN BLANKS .080 Aluminum pre-drilled
Description Est Qty Each
127X 127 50 1.95 2.40 No Bid 2.39 2.00 No Bid 5.89 3.28 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 1.97 2.03 1.95 No Bid 3.18 2.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid
127x 18" 100 293 3.60 No Bid 3.47 3.00 No Bid 7.36 4.61 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.00 3.05 293 No Bid 4.14 3.06 No Bid No Bid No Bid
247 x 307 300 9.74 11.75 No Bid 11.20 10.00 No Bid 26.25 13.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 10.16 10.15 9.75 No Bid 10.92 10.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid
127 x 36" 200 5.85 7.05 No Bid 6.73 6.00 No Bid 16.84 8.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.31 6.09 5.85 No Bid 7.05 6.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid
187 x 18" 100 4.39 5.29 No Bid 5.21 4.50 No Bid 11.81 6.67 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.50 4.57 4.39 No Bid 5.60 4.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid
307 x 36" 50 14.60 17.62 No Bid 16.78 15.00 No Bid 39.38 21.07 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.01 15.23 14.63 No Bid 15.75 15.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid
247 x 107 50 3.27 4.00 No Bid 3.79 4.00 No Bid 10.50 6.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.46 3.38 3.26 No Bid 4.46 3.40 No Bid No Bid No Bid
187 x24” 300 5.85 7.05 No Bid 6.83 6.00 No Bid 15.75 8.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 6.00 6.09 5.85 No Bid 7.05 6.12 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30"x30"x30" (R1-2 Triangle Yeild) 50 6.48 8.20 No Bid 7.05 11.00 No Bid 16.80 17.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.07 6.99 5.28 No Bid 7.29 6.38 No Bid No Bid No Bid
DIAMOND
247 x 247 300 7.79 9.40 No Bid 9.04 8.00 No Bid 17.00 11.97 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.13 8.12 7.80 No Bid 8.98 8.16 No Bid No Bid No Bid
307 x 30" 250 12.16 14.69 No Bid 14.08 12.50 No Bid 26.56 18.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.49 12.64 12.19 No Bid 13.33 12.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid
OCTAGON

30" x 30" 400 11.58 13.90 No Bid 12.69 12.50 No Bid 22.00 18.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.12 12.69 11.75 No Bid 12.74 12.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid
187 x 18" 25 4.26 5.20 No Bid 5.21 4.50 No Bid 13.20 8.99 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.56 4.57 5.00 No Bid 6.16 4.59 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SIGN FACES (Pressure Sensitive, Prismatic Face) HIGH
INTENSITY
Description Est Qty Each
127 x 36” Object Marker 200 4.10 4.92 No Bid 4.97 4.50 No Bid 525 9.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.20 No Bid 4.35 No Bid 6.32 4.08 11.45 No Bid No Bid
30" x 30” Stop 400 8.53 10.25 No Bid 10.08 9.38 No Bid 15.94 20.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.75 No Bid 9.06 No Bid 10.19 8.50 23.35 No Bid No Bid
187 x 18” Speed Advisory 50 3.08 3.69 No Bid 3.79 3.38 No Bid 8.50 7.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.15 No Bid 3.26 No Bid 5.46 3.06 8.75 No Bid No Bid
187 x 18” slow (flagging sign) 25 3.08 3.69 No Bid 3.79 338 No Bid 9.45 7.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.15 No Bid 3.26 No Bid 10.72 3.06 8.75 No Bid No Bid
187 x 18” stop (flagging sign) 25 3.08 3.69 No Bid 3.79 3.38 No Bid 9.45 7.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.15 No Bid 3.26 No Bid included 3.06 8.75 No Bid No Bid




30"x30"x30" (R1-2 Triangle Yeild) 50 6.83 5.80 No Bid 5.40 7.50 No Bid 15.66 17.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.57 No Bid 271 No Bid 6.48 4.25 10.45 No Bid No Bid
Various Messages and Colors for the Following Sizes

187 x 24" 300 4.10 4.92 No Bid 4.80 4.50 No Bid 18.15 9.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 4.20 No Bid 4.44 No Bid No Bid 4.44 11.45 No Bid No Bid
247 x24” 250 5.46 5.56 No Bid 6.26 6.00 No Bid 23.45 13.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5.60 No Bid 5.92 No Bid No Bid 5.92 15.25 No Bid No Bid
30" x 30”7 250 8.53 10.25 No Bid 9.59 9.38 No Bid 34.35 20.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8.75 No Bid 9.25 No Bid No Bid 9.25 23.35 No Bid No Bid
367 x36” 100 12.29 14.76 No Bid 14.00 13.50 No Bid 47.45 29.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.60 No Bid 13.32 No Bid No Bid 13.32 33.40 No Bid No Bid
247 x 307 300 6.83 8.20 No Bid 7.77 7.50 No Bid 30.25 16.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 7.00 No Bid 7.40 No Bid No Bid 7.40 18.75 No Bid No Bid
ROLL GOODS (Engineer Grade, Pressure Sensitive)

Description Est Qty Each

Black 30” x 50 yds 4rolls 236.25 363.30 No Bid 397.00 412.50 No Bid No Bid 431.25 356.25 No Bid No Bid 292.50 No Bid 380.42 No Bid 280.50 No Bid No Bid 255.00 400.00 No Bid No Bid
White 307 x 50 yds 6 Rolls 243.95 324.40 No Bid 310.00 412.50 No Bid No Bid 431.25 356.25 No Bid No Bid 292.50 No Bid 336.26 No Bid 280.50 No Bid No Bid 255.00 400.00 No Bid No Bid
Orange 30” x 50 yds 1Roll 243.95 324.40 No Bid 310.00 412.50 No Bid No Bid 431.25 356.25 No Bid No Bid 292.50 No Bid 302.14 No Bid 280.50 No Bid No Bid 255.00 400.00 No Bid No Bid
Red 30" x 50 yds 1Rolls 243.95 324.40 No Bid 310.00 412.50 No Bid No Bid 431.25 356.25 No Bid No Bid 292.50 No Bid 336.26 No Bid 280.50 No Bid No Bid 255.00 400.00 No Bid No Bid
Blue 307 x 50 yds 1Rolls 243.95 324.40 No Bid 310.00 412.50 No Bid No Bid 431.25 356.25 No Bid No Bid 292.50 No Bid 336.26 No Bid 280.50 No Bid No Bid 255.00 400.00 No Bid No Bid
Yellow 30 x 50 yds 1Roll 243.95 324.40 No Bid 310.00 412.50 No Bid No Bid 431.25 356.25 No Bid No Bid 292.50 No Bid 336.26 No Bid 280.50 No Bid No Bid 255.00 400.00 No Bid No Bid
Green 30” x 50 yds 1Roll 243.95 324.40 No Bid 310.00 412.50 No Bid No Bid 431.25 356.25 No Bid No Bid 292.50 No Bid 336.26 No Bid 280.50 No Bid No Bid 255.00 400.00 No Bid No Bid
Barricade Tape 67 x 50 yds 8 Rolls 90.00 99.75 No Bid 98.00 145.00 No Bid No Bid 86.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid 61.50 No Bid 86.42 No Bid 238.00 No Bid No Bid 66.75 400.00 No Bid No Bid
TRANSFER TAPE-(paper)

67 x 50 yds 8 Rolls 15.48 31.40 No Bid 37.53 8.25 No Bid No Bid 12.75 17.64 No Bid No Bid 22.50 No Bid 12.24 No Bid 22.80 No Bid 33.27 22.75 34.00 No Bid No Bid
127 x 50 yds 8Rolls 30.98 62.80 No Bid 64.69 16.50 No Bid No Bid 25.50 35.28 No Bid No Bid 45.00 No Bid 16.29 No Bid 45.60 No Bid 60.79 42.00 58.00 No Bid No Bid
187 x 50 yds 6 Rolls 46.48 94.22 No Bid 91.41 24.75 No Bid No Bid 38.25 52.92 No Bid No Bid 67.50 No Bid 33.89 No Bid 68.40 No Bid 88.30 63.00 82.00 No Bid No Bid
247 x 50 yds 5 Rolls 61.98 125.63 No Bid 12.81 33.00 No Bid No Bid 51.00 70.56 No Bid No Bid 90.00 No Bid 45.19 No Bid 90.50 No Bid 115.82 84.00 106.00 No Bid No Bid
307 x 50 yds 5 Rolls 77.48 157.00 No Bid 154.27 41.25 No Bid No Bid 63.75 88.20 No Bid No Bid 112.50 No Bid 56.48 No Bid 114.00 No Bid 143.34 105.00 140.25 No Bid No Bid
SIGN POST (#2 U-CHANNEL, GREEN PAINTED)

Description Est Qty Each

8 150 No Bid 12.00 No Bid 14.16 12.45 13.45 10.98 14.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 11.94 1110 12.08 No Bid 10.66 10.86 13.50 No Bid No Bid
SIGN POST (SQUARE TUBING)

10” 1000 No Bid 23.80 No Bid 28.52 23.76 17.04 16.95 22.87 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 26.96 19.98 25.38 No Bid 25.49 29.54 26.50 No Bid No Bid
12 100 No Bid 28.50 No Bid 34.21 28.26 20.23 20.25 27.04 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 32.34 23.98 3.03 No Bid 29.78 35.45 31.00 No Bid No Bid
3’ ANCHOR 1000 No Bid 10.60 No Bid 9.18 11.00 7.14 7.95 11.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 9.89 8.70 8.50 No Bid 9.41 9.49 11.25 No Bid No Bid
SIGN MOUNTING BRACKETS (52-5 IN. BLADE HOLDER,

SECURITY FOR FLAT BLADES)

Description Est Qty Each

U-CHANNEL POST CAPS

(90 degree) 150 2.60 2.98 No Bid 2.77 10.00 No Bid 6.70 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.10 2.60 2.97 No Bid 4.76 3.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
(180 degree) 150 2.60 2.98 No Bid 2.77 10.00 No Bid 5.85 4.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.10 2.60 3.33 No Bid 531 3.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid
SIGN CROSSES (90 Degree) 200 2.99 3.30 No Bid 2.98 10.00 No Bid 5.50 4.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.25 2.60 3.33 No Bid 4.66 3.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid




BARRICADE LIGHTS (6 VOLT FLASHER WITH SOLAR

SWITCH)

Description Est Qty Each

Lights 50 No Bid 13.80 15.75 22.86 20.23 No Bid No Bid 16.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.85 No Bid No Bid No Bid 13.93 15.75 37.00 No Bid No Bid
6 volt lantern batteries 84 No Bid 2.75 3.15 5.03 0.80 No Bid No Bid 3.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.78 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Total based on Individual Pricing




