FLOYD COUNTY GA QUOTE TABULATION
RFQ 18-1030 UNIFORMS FOR PUBLIC WORKS
Due 2pm 30 Oct 2018

Delivery from

Company TEE SHIRTS POLO SHIRTS SHOP UNIFORMS ARO Quote Total Contact Info
Silver Screen Design 823.08 994.50 424.88 15 Days 2242.46 |cheryl@silverscreendesign.com
Arena Sports USA 1204.50 1120.00 1312.00 7-10 Days 3636.50 arenasports271@gmail.com
Safety Products Inc 804.00 1576.00 2697.00 14 Days 5077.00 |sware@spisafety.com

2imprint Inc 765.00 956.00 436.60 15-20 Days 2157.60 bids@4imprint.com

All American Uniform 1364.70 1945.20 1719.00 20 Days 5028.90 |allamericanuniform@gmail.com
Prudential Overall Supply 1729.12 1310.48 979.31 10 Days 4018.91 |MikeRay@pos-clean.com
Express Press 1085.38 904.98 1341.50 16 Days 3331.86 austin@express-press.net
Dollar Bonaza LLC 1757.32 No Bid No Bid 3 Days 1757.32 dollarbonanzallc@gmail.com
MarchMaster Inc 2010.00 3360.00 No Bid 20 Days 5370.00 |jmarchmaster@yahoo.com
Arrow Safety Device 1925.64 1782.40 1718.24 30 Days 5426.28 rcannon@arrowsouthpenn.com
Uniform Source 1319.50 1094.00 1553.00 14 Days 3966.50 stephus2141@gmail.com
Ascend Advertising 1848.06 1559.20 1447.72 12 Days 4854.98 advertising@ascendpromo.com
Galls 1556.00 1464.00 1318.00 20-30 Days 4338.00 cummins-daniel@galls.com
Logo Man Marketing 1135.76 1030.40 1088.93 10 Days 3255.09 lbiz@logomanmarketing.com

T Box Tactical 1330.83 1103.48 1470.73 10-14 Days 3905.04 alice@tboxtac.com

DVL Ent (DBA MPG Tandem) 929.94 1009.00 1242.71 15-16 Days 3181.65 aertel@mpgtandem.com

Paper Pack 1483.68 1287.20 No Bid 15 Days 2770.88 russwimpee@paperpackinc.com
The Golden Standard Uniform Co No Bid 1272.80 1283.85 10-20 Days 2556.65 [RO@goldenstandarduniform.com
Advance Digital Solutions Int LLC 2182.00 1664.00 1720.50 Not Provided 5566.50 uk4 @gsa-adsii.com

Advertising Dynamics 1636.74 1117.96 1210.19 10-14 Days 3964.89 |[syl1125@aol.com

Uniform Sales America 1841.92 1335.88 1481.99 28-42 Days 4659.79 npatel@uniform-sales.com

KDA Prints LLC 1460.00 1880.00 1966.00 10 Days 5306.00 aales@kdaprints.com

Hi Tech Ad Specialties 1112.00 1304.00 1382.00 14 Days 3798.00 hitechadspecialties@gmail.com
TQBM Inc 1588.10 823.20 No Bid 30-45 Days 2411.30 ngozi.ezimako@tgbminc.com
Southern Branding Company 2095.20 1092.94 No Bid 14 Days 3188.14 |kim@southernbrandingco.com

Pricing in Blue indicates a Partial Quote
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