FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA - BID TABULATION

TRAFFIC PAINT AND SIGN MATERIALS
BID 17-0727 Due 2PM 27 July 2017

TrabLic Sians v | Mo Bid Ne Bid I3,009.50 | 12,337.00 | 5,696.3] No Bid /1 378.00 | No Bid
Lighile EnTerpv‘lSes. No | No Bid No Bid 2)7132.50 | 1535750 | 7,326.95| 37,250.00| 1,554.00 | F2/.00
oty Zone | | NoBid | NoBd | NoBid | NeBid | NoBid | NoBid | NoBid | 105270
Hall | Sians v4 No Bid  Nb Bid | 20,560.75 | )4, 508.50 | B,435. 62| 43245.00 L YR 00| ], 86552
Timfece SQBSHQSQLD,'S{_ NO | 2970000 | G480.00 | /8,987.50 | 14,160.00 | &,06525 | 39,463.50| 5,000.00 /, 07870
Mlied Tube V' | NeBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | 28,220.50  No Bid | Mo Bid

GA Correctonal Trd| V| 150,500.00 | No Bid 42,383.50 | 42,82050| MNoBid | 28,572.00| 2,932.80 | No Bid
Transafe. v 35,790.00 | 10,560.00 27,657.25 | 30,300.00 Q,371.25  3%,944.00| 2,225.00 | ([/57.50
Scaif oG Safty v/ No Bid No Bid | MNoBid No Bid | ,873.43 MNoBid | NoBid | No Bid
Swarco Y NoBid | 7,920.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | No Bid
Ennis Pant v | 25,600.00 | 33,660.00 | Np Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
Nippon Carbide. v No Bid No Brd Mo Bid No Bid 6, 8337.000 Ao Bid | Mo Bid | No Bid
Dotver \ndustries| v/ NoBid | )2,000.00 | No Bid No Bld No Bid No B d | No Bid | No Bid
Vulean Sians v/ Mo Bid | No Bid )8,35%.00| /3,09/-00 68177 44, 875.00| ), 580.00 | [/, 142.50p
MD Solubons | Ao NoBid | Mo Bid 19,00975 | NoBid | MNeBid | 32,743.00 /30000 | NoBid

I certify the bids listed above were received prior to the deadline and opened and read aloud in public.

Ecrctt Gy CPPB%/] 7/27/17 2PM




FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA - BID TABULATION
TRAFFIC PAINT AND SIGN MATERIALS

Supplier Addendum 1 Traffic Paint Glass Spheres Sign Blanks Sign Faces RollGoods | Sign Posts Sign Brackets Lights and Batteries
Dnwversal Siqns v/ NoBid | No8Bid | 18,050.50| /3,632.00 8,/89.60 | 38717.00| /,620.00| Ny Bid
Drde Em@“i;gs v/ | 25,200.00 | No Bid No Bid | No Bid Mo Bid | Mo Bid | No Bid | No Bed
Newman Sfcms ~ No No Bid | Ne Bid 20,535.50 4,205,00| 2,573.08y 39,477.00 | 2,4U2L30| 6%6-S0F
Dsburn Assn. | V' Mo Bid | Mo Bid [9,084-T15 | 3,41, 00 | 6,300.00 |y, 204,00 |, 425.60| ], 02/.02
Rudsale v 322(0,00 | 10,920.00| NoBid | 3507150 |1,659.25| y2,875.00| Mo Bid | [, 850.00p
perwn Williawd N0 | 26,250.00 | 9,360.00 No Bid Ne Bid No Bid No Bid MNo Bid | No Bid
Dzare. MH. | V' | 25,390,00 | No Bid No Bid | No Bid Mo Bid WMo Bid | Mo Bid | Ny BiAd

ify the bids listed above were received prior to the deadline and opened and read aloud in public.
stt oy CP% 7/27/17 2PM
T



