
FLOYD COUNTY GEORGIA
 
BID TABULATION FORM
 

Bid 16-1229 SHERIFF'S UNIFORMS
 
DUE 2PM 29 DECEMBER 2016
 

S1Y\'Im o. T+! South KEEPRS CIa II S Adve.r-ns}~ Pap?rP(.\c.k:: QT 
Company f>oHce. UniPorms Eo..*rf'\ Dy nClm\(..s Inc, Dlstt\bu1o~S 

I)l$1t1~s ~t\c.. sn1r+ 
References y y NO 61 D Y Y J. (one) 1. (one) YDOCLJ mEtJTS 
Deliver (Stock 15 -30 Jo.'tS 1we.e..k , P~\~ 

1-144~~S 7-}D do.."15 12 do..vs 12 dfAys 7 do.."/sItems) ?A~"T~ 
Deliver (Non Stock 

~-45 do.~c:, 2 wu}<.s r 1~"30dCl~S 3O-l.\:5d~~5 var,es /g da.to 3OdCk'ls Items) 

UNIFORMS (BY 

ITEM) 

1 No 6/0 q,ISg./D \ 7,728.00 . ~,l20,OO I tlo BIb No 8/D 
2 r 3, 4g~·8D \ 2,q¢-/.00 2,5"0.00 t I 
3 \ lo/l;?5-80 \ 7,Q'80,OO #] SIeD.DO ~ I 
4 , 

~,~3~·tfD \. :3,1)'/-0.00 218~O,OO 
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5 ) '7,'195'.2.0 \ ~ 11'-1100 8. LlOO,DO --l \ \ 
6 ~NO BID 2,'1"1. bO 

, 
3,'1-72.00 3,zro,oo Vol \ \-

7 /2,4Cf 3.15 It.f, 000.00 15,31;,2,50 10, DOC. DO r7 \ , 
8 2,4cr 5.15 2,/25. DO 2,100,00 2f;lXJ·OO 
9 J ,~47.50 1,4t/O,50 1,12.0.00 I Z:D,CX) J J 

10 3/175.00 2,925,00 2,355, CJO 3,OOOd)O " I 

11 7,"3~. 00 9,;('60.00 J '1, tJ50,DO 1,foOO100 NO Bib No BID 
12 r: r I /' -: I I 
13 l ( / \ \ \ ~ 
14 \ \ / \ \ \ \ 
15 \ \ / 

" " 
, 

16 ) ) I .....J J l I \.J/ 
.. ------~~----------



AdvemSi ~ Rtper{bck GTsouth­
GALL'SEq:;krn Dynanu'cs :ene. Dl~h~rs

Shir+ 
17 ) \ / S -~ ) ~ 
18 'i42.50 l2Zg.50 / 76,2.50 ~OOIOO NO BID NO BID 
19 5D4.40 to ICS, '/-0 / 3Q2,oo 320.00 I I /" 
20 3"(.50 ~o9·30 22'3,00 1.350.00 , 

I '" 
21 /, Jqt./,QlJ. 1,3bO:60 G, oa.oo '12.0.00 ~ \ 
22 2'15,00 4/~·()O Z75,00 100,00 ' ' \I \ \TTf 

23 I, Q'Ir;" 25 9?8.15 IcD7,50 (0(5,00 ) ,~ \ \ 

24 4,1oJ.5.00 5/~57.50 \ 4, /XOG,OO 4000,00 m ) 
25 1,550,00 2, '1-74-,00 \ 3#0,00 I.DOo,OO 

vv No at]) II-
26 3/1'O(p,Dc> if. 'll/-lf, 00 \ 4/~q.o,OO (P,~OD,OO rJ '5~e. BID NO BID 
27 ( ( \ { ( ( ( 
28 ) ) \ ~ .) ) ) 
29 /, / lo'1/JO I(3£10,5D I ;/57,50 1,,5C,OO SEE B)D NO 81D 
30 I, l{-"i>3. 00 1.134,00 I10raO,00 l~,OO 8'1,50 ( 
31 I, ftJC}.3.oo I 134,00 \ 1/5301'00 I U-OO,OO qq. 50 \, 

32 ~qt..(,oo 537,'2$0 \ I.D ':/1, 00 (oOO,OD NO BI1) \ 
33 200·()O 288.10 \ ;<00.00 220,00 S ) 
34 No BID CLt+?,£.J,oo ?,qoo,oo l,brooo NO Btl) NO BI.l) 

FOOTWEAR 

1 QQ,50 5"9.99 IOD.OO CICJ.oO NO BID /'10 BID ~t.I-. 0' 
2 qq,50 c Sq· 91 100.00 Cf'1·oo I /" NO BIl) 
3 ~9·3f; qc.oo Q7.50 qa,Do ( l 35,78 
4 '6Cf,85 tj(p,oo Q7,50 qo.QO \ \ gS,49 
5 <:gq.oo <;fto ,00 / 77,00 12.·C() \ NO BID 
6 79.QS ec:» / 70,~O '12..00 \ No BIb 
7 78, Co ~ 80.00 / 75,.30 12...00 ) I lPlp,IO 
8 ~,.~s g8~oo / 7'3·/0 72..00 ./ / 0g·L\5 
9 15,00 82.00 / 1:/1,7D bft> .00 No BID No 8/1) to i. lO 
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