
Company Fittings Valves Hydrants Total

Understands Delivery 

terms for 20-31 Oct Remarks

Piping Supply 3405.08 3112.03 4298.19 10815.30 Yes Valves Not AFC

Kendall Supply 3462.20 No Bid No Bid 3462.20 Yes Partial bid

Utilities Supply Inc 5276.00 3710.00 No Bid 8986.00 Yes Partial Bid

Hayes Pipe Supply Inc 3787.50 3450.00 No Bid 7237.50 Yes Partial Bid

HD Supply WaterWorks 3770.00 No Bid 4810.50 8580.50 Yes Partial Bid

Consolidated Pipe 3849.00 No Bid 5175.00 9024.00 Yes Partial bid

Ferguson Waterworks 3880.67 3914.31 No Bid 7794.98 Yes Partial bid

FLOYD COUNTY GA

QUOTE TABULATION
RFQ 14-1002-1 Fittings, Valves and Hydrants

Due 2 Oct 2014 at 2pm


